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you grant lenovo and other users of the platform a non
exclusive royalty free transferable sub licensable
worldwide license to use store display reproduce modify
create derivative works of perform publish re post re
tweet and distribute your content on or in connection with
the platform not only is tiktok a bodacious short video
platform but the videos themselves are also highly
interactive sharing your tiktok videos with others or
uploading content regularly will help you increase your
tiktok followers you represent and warrant that you have
all rights necessary in your content for it to be on or
available from the platform and that the posting and use
of your content on or through the platform does not
violate misappropriate or infringe on the rights of any third
party including without limitation privacy rights publicity
rights copyrights trademark and or other intellectual
property rights you further represent and warrant to the
extent there are links on the platform to your content that
is hosted on third party websites such linking is permitted
by the terms of service of any such third party websites
you agree to comply with all laws rules and regulations
applicable to your use of the platform and your content
including but not limited to copyright laws 1 minute ago
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tok followers free free tiktok likes app fast fans followers
tik tok can help you to get the very first fans for the tik tok
videos you will get to the key page and attract more
followers


