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sharing new content at least twice a day will eventually
get you a massive following because it will improve the
exposure your videos are getting but you also have to
post videos at the right time the magic posting hours on
tiktok are between 11 am and 5 pm as your followers and
their friends are most likely to use the app in that time
frame get to know your audience and try to understand
how frequently and at which hours they re using the tiktok
app this will help you create a posting schedule that
minimizes the chances of posting videos during parts of
the day when they get the least amount of exposure c you
have the full power and authority to enter into these terms
and to the extent that any entity is bound hereby to bind
such entity these terms and performance of obligations
under these terms do not and will not violate any other
agreement to which you or such entity is a party and as
one of the largest tiktok community in the world tiktokers
are able to help each other here to boost account in
different aspects like growing free likes and followers
importantly this app is free to use when using legion
community you will comply with all applicable laws and
regulations and all terms of use and similar rules
concerning your use of any social media outlet or other
third party publishing platform
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